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Since the first edition of Essentials of Firefighting was published in 1978, more than 2 million firefighters
have used the manual for training. Because so many successful firefighters have trained from this manual
over three decades, Essentials of Fire Fighting is often referred to as "the bible" of basic firefighter skills. In
addition, the information in Essentials is commonly accepted as the standard for fire fighting knowledge in
North America.

 
This 5th edition is a completely new revision and includes all the information needed to meet the fire
fighting requirements for National Fire Protection Association (NFPA®) 1001, Standard for Fire Fighter
Professional Qualifications (2008 edition), Fire Fighter Levels I and II. All photographs and illustrations are
in full color. This manual includes instructional tools such as learning objectives, key terms, case histories,
and review questions in each chapter to enhance a student's understanding. To help students with
psychomotor learning, skill sheets depicting firefighter skills are included in most chapters. These feature
step-by-step photographs and instructions for completing each skill. Each manual also includes a bonus CD-
ROM that provides additional learning materials, case studies, animations, and learning activities.
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From reader reviews:

Donald McLaughlin:

Hey guys, do you wishes to finds a new book to read? May be the book with the concept Essentials of Fire
Fighting (5th Edition) suitable to you? The particular book was written by well-known writer in this era.
Typically the book untitled Essentials of Fire Fighting (5th Edition)is the main of several books that will
everyone read now. This specific book was inspired a lot of people in the world. When you read this guide
you will enter the new shape that you ever know ahead of. The author explained their idea in the simple way,
and so all of people can easily to recognise the core of this publication. This book will give you a wide range
of information about this world now. In order to see the represented of the world in this book.

Tom Copper:

Reading a guide tends to be new life style on this era globalization. With reading you can get a lot of
information that can give you benefit in your life. Along with book everyone in this world can certainly share
their idea. Publications can also inspire a lot of people. Plenty of author can inspire all their reader with their
story or their experience. Not only the storyplot that share in the ebooks. But also they write about the
knowledge about something that you need case in point. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach
children, there are many kinds of book which exist now. The authors nowadays always try to improve their
talent in writing, they also doing some investigation before they write to their book. One of them is this
Essentials of Fire Fighting (5th Edition).

Shirley Morales:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray anyone, why because this Essentials of Fire Fighting (5th Edition)
book written by well-known writer who knows well how to make book that may be understand by anyone
who have read the book. Written within good manner for you, dripping every ideas and creating skill only
for eliminate your current hunger then you still skepticism Essentials of Fire Fighting (5th Edition) as good
book not only by the cover but also through the content. This is one guide that can break don't ascertain book
by its deal with, so do you still needing one more sixth sense to pick this specific!? Oh come on your reading
through sixth sense already told you so why you have to listening to another sixth sense.

John Montes:

You may spend your free time to learn this book this e-book. This Essentials of Fire Fighting (5th Edition) is
simple to develop you can read it in the park your car, in the beach, train as well as soon. If you did not have
much space to bring typically the printed book, you can buy the particular e-book. It is make you much
easier to read it. You can save the particular book in your smart phone. Thus there are a lot of benefits that
you will get when you buy this book.
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