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This volume provides a detailed treatment of half-metallic materials and their properties from both an
experimental and theoretical point of view. It discusses the methods used to understand and predict the
properties of half-metals and the gamut of other materials amenable to these techniques. It also offers an
expansive bibliography to facilitate further and deeper research. This book provides the precise definitions of
all key terminology used in the vast and varied literature.

This is the first comprehensive monograph on the subject and will serve as a starting point for graduate
students and senior researchers who wish to enter the field. This book will also be an invaluable reference to
those already working in the areaof half-metallic materials.

Contents:

Introduction●

Methods of Studying Half-Metals●

Heusler Alloys●

Half-Metallic Oxides●

Half-Metals with Simple Structures●

Readership: Graduate students and researchers working in the field of half-metallic materials.
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From reader reviews:

Winston Craig:

Typically the book Half-Metallic Materials and Their Properties: 2 (Materials for Engineering) will bring
that you the new experience of reading a book. The author style to describe the idea is very unique. If you try
to find new book to read, this book very suited to you. The book Half-Metallic Materials and Their
Properties: 2 (Materials for Engineering) is much recommended to you to see. You can also get the e-book
from the official web site, so you can easier to read the book.

Lela Koehn:

Half-Metallic Materials and Their Properties: 2 (Materials for Engineering) can be one of your beginning
books that are good idea. We all recommend that straight away because this book has good vocabulary that
can increase your knowledge in words, easy to understand, bit entertaining but still delivering the
information. The article writer giving his/her effort to set every word into joy arrangement in writing Half-
Metallic Materials and Their Properties: 2 (Materials for Engineering) but doesn't forget the main place,
giving the reader the hottest and also based confirm resource information that maybe you can be among it.
This great information can easily drawn you into new stage of crucial imagining.

Jennifer Wilson:

Many people spending their period by playing outside having friends, fun activity having family or just
watching TV all day long. You can have new activity to invest your whole day by reading a book. Ugh, do
you think reading a book can really hard because you have to use the book everywhere? It okay you can have
the e-book, delivering everywhere you want in your Mobile phone. Like Half-Metallic Materials and Their
Properties: 2 (Materials for Engineering) which is keeping the e-book version. So , why not try out this
book? Let's view.

Jean Mora:

A lot of e-book has printed but it differs. You can get it by net on social media. You can choose the top book
for you, science, comic, novel, or whatever by means of searching from it. It is called of book Half-Metallic
Materials and Their Properties: 2 (Materials for Engineering). You'll be able to your knowledge by it.
Without departing the printed book, it might add your knowledge and make you actually happier to read. It is
most crucial that, you must aware about publication. It can bring you from one destination to other place.
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