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Seventeen-year-old Arion Rush has always played the obedient sidekick to her older sister’s flashy femme
fatale—until a mysterious boating accident leaves Lilah a silent, traumatized stranger. As her sister awaits
medical treatment with their mother, Arion and their father head to his hometown in Maine to prepare a new
life for them all. Surrounded by the vast Atlantic, songwriting is Arion’s only solace, her solid ground.

Unexpectedly, Arion blossoms in the tiny coastal town. Friends flock to her, and Logan Delaine, a volatile
heartthrob, seems downright smitten. But it’s Bo Summers—a solitary surfer, as alluring as he is aloof—that
Arion can’t shake. Meanwhile, Lilah’s worsening condition, a string of local fatalities, and Arion’s own
recent brushes with death seem ominously linked…to Bo’s otherworldly family. As Arion’s feelings for Bo
intensify and his affections turn possessive, she must make a choice. How will Arion learn to listen to her
own voice when Bo’s siren song won’t stop ringing in her ears?
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From reader reviews:

Mary Stockton:

Reading a reserve tends to be new life style with this era globalization. With reading through you can get a
lot of information that may give you benefit in your life. Using book everyone in this world may share their
idea. Textbooks can also inspire a lot of people. Plenty of author can inspire their particular reader with their
story or even their experience. Not only situation that share in the books. But also they write about the ability
about something that you need example. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your young ones,
there are many kinds of book which exist now. The authors on this planet always try to improve their skill in
writing, they also doing some study before they write with their book. One of them is this Shining Sea.

Pauline Bardwell:

Do you have something that that suits you such as book? The guide lovers usually prefer to pick book like
comic, limited story and the biggest you are novel. Now, why not trying Shining Sea that give your
entertainment preference will be satisfied simply by reading this book. Reading addiction all over the world
can be said as the means for people to know world considerably better then how they react towards the
world. It can't be said constantly that reading routine only for the geeky man or woman but for all of you
who wants to end up being success person. So , for all of you who want to start reading through as your good
habit, you are able to pick Shining Sea become your personal starter.

Joseph Vargas:

Beside this specific Shining Sea in your phone, it could give you a way to get more close to the new
knowledge or details. The information and the knowledge you are going to got here is fresh through the oven
so don't become worry if you feel like an aged people live in narrow small town. It is good thing to have
Shining Sea because this book offers for you readable information. Do you oftentimes have book but you
rarely get what it's all about. Oh come on, that won't happen if you have this with your hand. The Enjoyable
agreement here cannot be questionable, such as treasuring beautiful island. Techniques you still want to miss
the idea? Find this book and read it from at this point!

Terry Hollis:

Is it anyone who having spare time in that case spend it whole day by means of watching television programs
or just laying on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Shining Sea can be the solution, oh how
comes? A fresh book you know. You are thus out of date, spending your extra time by reading in this fresh
era is common not a nerd activity. So what these textbooks have than the others?
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