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In his new book, Tony Le Tissier provides the first detailed account of the Soviet-German conflict east of
Berlin, culminating in 1945 with the last major land battle in Europe that proved decisive for the fate of
Berlin. When the first Red Army soldier reached the Oder on the 31st of January, everyone at the Soviet
Headquarters expected Marshall Zhukov's troops to bring a quick end to the war. However, despite desperate
fighting by both sides, a stalemate persisted for two months, at the end of which the Soviet bridgeheads north
and south of Kustrin were united and the fortress finally fell. By drawing not only on official sources, but
also on the accounts of individuals involved, Le Tissier meticulously reconstructs the difficult breakthrough
achieved on the Oder: the establishment of bridgeheads, the battle for the fortress of Kustrin, the bloody fight
for Seelow Heights. Numerous maps and step by step illustrations show the operations of both contestants in
detail and reveal a most interesting episode in the history of the Second World War in Europe.

In his new book, Tony Le Tissier provides the first detailed account of the Soviet-German conflict east of
Berlin, culminating in 1945 with the last major land battle in Europe that proved decisive for the fate of
Berlin. When the first Red Army soldier reached the Oder on the 31st of January, everyone at the Soviet
Headquarters expected Marshall Zhukov's troops to bring a quick end to the war. However, despite desperate
fighting by both sides, a stalemate persisted for two months, at the end of which the Soviet bridgeheads north
and south of Kustrin were united, and the fortress finally fell.

By drawing not only on official sources, but also on the accounts of individuals involved, Le Tissier
meticulously reconstructs the difficult breakthrough achieved on the Oder: the establishment of bridgeheads,
the battle for the fortress of Kustrin, and the bloody fight for Seelow Heights. Numerous maps and step by
step illustrations show the operations of both contestants in detail and reveal a most interesting episode in the
history of the Second World War in Europe.
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From reader reviews:

Billie Duran:

Have you spare time to get a day? What do you do when you have much more or little spare time? Yes, you
can choose the suitable activity for spend your time. Any person spent all their spare time to take a walk,
shopping, or went to the actual Mall. How about open as well as read a book titled Zhukov At the Oder: The
Decisive Battle for Berlin? Maybe it is being best activity for you. You realize beside you can spend your
time along with your favorite's book, you can wiser than before. Do you agree with the opinion or you have
some other opinion?

Janet Huynh:

What do you with regards to book? It is not important along? Or just adding material if you want something
to explain what yours problem? How about your extra time? Or are you busy person? If you don't have spare
time to complete others business, it is make you feel bored faster. And you have spare time? What did you
do? Everyone has many questions above. They should answer that question mainly because just their can do
that. It said that about publication. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it is correct. Because start from on
jardín de infancia until university need that Zhukov At the Oder: The Decisive Battle for Berlin to read.

Octavio Martin:

Information is provisions for people to get better life, information these days can get by anyone on
everywhere. The information can be a know-how or any news even a huge concern. What people must be
consider while those information which is inside former life are difficult to be find than now could be taking
seriously which one works to believe or which one the resource are convinced. If you get the unstable
resource then you buy it as your main information it will have huge disadvantage for you. All those
possibilities will not happen inside you if you take Zhukov At the Oder: The Decisive Battle for Berlin as
your daily resource information.

Vincent Newton:

This Zhukov At the Oder: The Decisive Battle for Berlin is great book for you because the content which is
full of information for you who also always deal with world and also have to make decision every minute.
That book reveal it information accurately using great arrange word or we can state no rambling sentences
within it. So if you are read the item hurriedly you can have whole info in it. Doesn't mean it only provides
straight forward sentences but tough core information with splendid delivering sentences. Having Zhukov At
the Oder: The Decisive Battle for Berlin in your hand like having the world in your arm, details in it is not
ridiculous one particular. We can say that no e-book that offer you world within ten or fifteen second right
but this book already do that. So , this is good reading book. Hey Mr. and Mrs. stressful do you still doubt
this?
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