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Indonesia's Muslims are still pondering the role of religion in public life. Although the religious violence
marring the transition towards democratic reform has ebbed, the Muslim community has polarised into
reactionary and progressive camps with increasingly antagonistic views on the place of Islam in society.
Debates over the underlying principles of democratisation have further heated up after a fatwa issued by
conservative religious scholars condemned secularism, pluralism and liberalism as un-Islamic.

With a hesitant government dominated by Indonesia's eternal political elites failing to take a clear stance,
supporters of the decision are pursuing their Islamisation agendas with renewed vigour, displaying growing
intolerance towards other religions and what they consider deviant Muslim minorities. Extremist and radical
exponents of this Islamist bloc receive more international media coverage and scholarly attention than their
progressive opponents who are defiantly challenging this reactionary trend. Calling for a true transformation
of Indonesian society based on democratic principles and respect for human rights, they insist that this
depends on secularisation, religious toleration, and freethinking.

Conceived as a contemporary history of ideas, this book aims to tell the story of these open- minded
intellectuals and activists in the world's largest Muslim country.
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From reader reviews:

Madeleine Bandy:

What do you concentrate on book? It is just for students since they are still students or the item for all people
in the world, what best subject for that? Simply you can be answered for that question above. Every person
has various personality and hobby for each other. Don't to be compelled someone or something that they
don't need do that. You must know how great along with important the book Islam in Indonesia: The Contest
for Society, Ideas and Values. All type of book could you see on many options. You can look for the internet
solutions or other social media.

Dennis Bloom:

Playing with family inside a park, coming to see the ocean world or hanging out with close friends is thing
that usually you might have done when you have spare time, after that why you don't try factor that really
opposite from that. A single activity that make you not sense tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you are ride on and with addition of knowledge. Even you love Islam in Indonesia: The Contest for
Society, Ideas and Values, you can enjoy both. It is good combination right, you still would like to miss it?
What kind of hang type is it? Oh come on its mind hangout guys. What? Still don't have it, oh come on its
referred to as reading friends.

Ida Green:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray you actually, why because this Islam in Indonesia: The Contest for
Society, Ideas and Values guide written by well-known writer whose to say well how to make book that may
be understand by anyone who read the book. Written in good manner for you, leaking every ideas and
publishing skill only for eliminate your own hunger then you still question Islam in Indonesia: The Contest
for Society, Ideas and Values as good book but not only by the cover but also by the content. This is one
guide that can break don't evaluate book by its deal with, so do you still needing yet another sixth sense to
pick this!? Oh come on your examining sixth sense already said so why you have to listening to another sixth
sense.

Oliver Lyle:

As a student exactly feel bored for you to reading. If their teacher asked them to go to the library or to make
summary for some book, they are complained. Just very little students that has reading's heart and soul or
real their interest. They just do what the educator want, like asked to go to the library. They go to at this time
there but nothing reading really. Any students feel that looking at is not important, boring and also can't see
colorful images on there. Yeah, it is for being complicated. Book is very important for you. As we know that
on this age, many ways to get whatever we really wish for. Likewise word says, many ways to reach
Chinese's country. Therefore , this Islam in Indonesia: The Contest for Society, Ideas and Values can make
you sense more interested to read.
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