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Owen Fiss has been a leading legal scholar for over thirty years, yet before 2001 it would have seemed
unlikely for him to write about national security and the laws of war; his focus was civil procedure and equal
protection, but when the War on Terror began to shroud legal proceedings in secrecy, he realized that the
bulwarks of procedure that shield the individual from the awesome power of the state were dissolving,
perhaps irreparably, and that it was time for him to speak up.

The ten chapters in this volume cover the major legal battlefronts of the War on Terror from Guantánamo to
drones, with a focus on the constitutional implications of those new tools. The underlying theme is Fiss's
concern for the offense done to the U.S. Constitution by the administrative and legislative branches of
government in the name of public safety and the refusal of the judiciary to hold the government accountable.
A War Like No Other will be an essential intellectual foundation for all concerned about constitutional rights
and the law in a new age.
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From reader reviews:

Keri Yokum:

The book A War Like No Other: The Constitution in a Time of Terror give you a sense of feeling enjoy for
your spare time. You should use to make your capable much more increase. Book can to be your best friend
when you getting stress or having big problem together with your subject. If you can make looking at a book
A War Like No Other: The Constitution in a Time of Terror to be your habit, you can get far more
advantages, like add your own capable, increase your knowledge about a few or all subjects. You could
know everything if you like open up and read a reserve A War Like No Other: The Constitution in a Time of
Terror. Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that, science publication or encyclopedia or other people. So ,
how do you think about this reserve?

Frances Stone:

A lot of people always spent their particular free time to vacation as well as go to the outside with them
friends and family or their friend. Were you aware? Many a lot of people spent these people free time just
watching TV, or perhaps playing video games all day long. If you would like try to find a new activity
honestly, that is look different you can read any book. It is really fun to suit your needs. If you enjoy the
book that you simply read you can spent the whole day to reading a e-book. The book A War Like No Other:
The Constitution in a Time of Terror it is quite good to read. There are a lot of individuals who
recommended this book. These were enjoying reading this book. In the event you did not have enough space
to develop this book you can buy the actual e-book. You can m0ore very easily to read this book from the
smart phone. The price is not very costly but this book provides high quality.

Roy Matsumoto:

The book untitled A War Like No Other: The Constitution in a Time of Terror contain a lot of information
on this. The writer explains your ex idea with easy technique. The language is very simple to implement all
the people, so do definitely not worry, you can easy to read the item. The book was published by famous
author. The author provides you in the new period of time of literary works. It is easy to read this book
because you can read on your smart phone, or gadget, so you can read the book with anywhere and anytime.
If you want to buy the e-book, you can open their official web-site as well as order it. Have a nice learn.

Lorraine Michael:

Is it you who having spare time in that case spend it whole day by watching television programs or just lying
down on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This A War Like No Other: The Constitution in a
Time of Terror can be the reply, oh how comes? The new book you know. You are therefore out of date,
spending your extra time by reading in this brand-new era is common not a geek activity. So what these
publications have than the others?
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