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Big Data Analytics with Spark is a step-by-step guide for learning Spark, which is an open-source fast and

general-purpose cluster computing framework for large-scale data analysis. You will learn how to use Spark

for different types of big data analytics projects, including batch, interactive, graph, and stream data analysis

as well as machine learning. In addition, this book will help you become a much sought-after Spark expert.

Spark is one of the hottest Big Data technologies. The amount of data generated today by devices,

applications and users is exploding. Therefore, there is a critical need for tools that can analyze large-scale

data and unlock value from it. Spark is a powerful technology that meets that need. You can, for example,

use Spark to perform low latency computations through the use of efficient caching and iterative algorithms;

leverage the features of its shell for easy and interactive Data analysis; employ its fast batch processing and

low latency features to process your real time data streams and so on. As a result, adoption of Spark is

rapidly growing and is replacing Hadoop MapReduce as the technology of choice for big data analytics.

This book provides an introduction to Spark and related big-data technologies. It covers Spark core and its

add-on libraries, including Spark SQL, Spark Streaming, GraphX, and MLlib. Big Data Analytics with Spark

is therefore written for busy professionals who prefer learning a new technology from a consolidated source

instead of spending countless hours on the Internet trying to pick bits and pieces from different sources.

The book also provides a chapter on Scala, the hottest functional programming language, and the program

that underlies Spark. You’ll learn the basics of functional programming in Scala, so that you can write Spark

applications in it.

What's more, Big Data Analytics with Spark provides an introduction to other big data technologies that are
commonly used along with Spark, like Hive, Avro, Kafka and so on. So the book is self-sufficient; all the
technologies that you need to know to use Spark are covered. The only thing that you are expected to know
is programming in any language.

There is a critical shortage of people with big data expertise, so companies are willing to pay top dollar for
people with skills in areas like Spark and Scala. So reading this book and absorbing its principles will
provide a boost—possibly a big boost—to your career.

What you’ll learn

1) Interactively analyze large-scale data with Spark



2) Write Spark applications in Scala for analyzing large-scale data in batch mode

3) Use Spark SQL to analyze large-scale data using standard SQL and Hive Query Language

4) Analyze large volume of stream data with Spark Streaming

5) Develop machine learning applications with MLlib

6) Deploy Spark in a variety of situations

Who this book is for

Big Data Analytics with Spark is for data scientists, business analysts, data architects, and data analysts
looking for a better and faster tool for large-scale data analysis. It is also for software engineers and
developers building Big Data products.
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From reader reviews:

Jennifer Oaks:

The knowledge that you get from Big Data Analytics with Spark: A Practitioner's Guide to Using Spark for
Large Scale Data Analysis will be the more deep you looking the information that hide in the words the more
you get serious about reading it. It does not mean that this book is hard to understand but Big Data Analytics
with Spark: A Practitioner's Guide to Using Spark for Large Scale Data Analysis giving you enjoyment
feeling of reading. The author conveys their point in specific way that can be understood by anyone who read
the idea because the author of this e-book is well-known enough. This book also makes your vocabulary
increase well. That makes it easy to understand then can go to you, both in printed or e-book style are
available. We advise you for having that Big Data Analytics with Spark: A Practitioner's Guide to Using
Spark for Large Scale Data Analysis instantly.

Loris Beal:

The book untitled Big Data Analytics with Spark: A Practitioner's Guide to Using Spark for Large Scale
Data Analysis contain a lot of information on the item. The writer explains your girlfriend idea with easy
technique. The language is very easy to understand all the people, so do not really worry, you can easy to
read the idea. The book was published by famous author. The author gives you in the new time of literary
works. You can actually read this book because you can read more your smart phone, or product, so you can
read the book throughout anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you can open their official
web-site in addition to order it. Have a nice go through.

Mary Ruch:

In this time globalization it is important to someone to find information. The information will make you to
definitely understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information better to
share. You can find a lot of references to get information example: internet, newspaper, book, and soon. You
will observe that now, a lot of publisher in which print many kinds of book. The actual book that
recommended to you personally is Big Data Analytics with Spark: A Practitioner's Guide to Using Spark for
Large Scale Data Analysis this book consist a lot of the information on the condition of this world now. That
book was represented so why is the world has grown up. The terminology styles that writer use to explain it
is easy to understand. Often the writer made some investigation when he makes this book. This is why this
book ideal all of you.

Michael Clark:

Do you like reading a guide? Confuse to looking for your favorite book? Or your book was rare? Why so
many problem for the book? But just about any people feel that they enjoy for reading. Some people likes
reading through, not only science book and also novel and Big Data Analytics with Spark: A Practitioner's
Guide to Using Spark for Large Scale Data Analysis or even others sources were given information for you.



After you know how the good a book, you feel wish to read more and more. Science publication was created
for teacher or maybe students especially. Those publications are helping them to put their knowledge. In
other case, beside science publication, any other book likes Big Data Analytics with Spark: A Practitioner's
Guide to Using Spark for Large Scale Data Analysis to make your spare time far more colorful. Many types
of book like this one.
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