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'The author offers opportunity to reflect upon experience and brings together reflective practice and work-
based learning, aiming to support the professional growth of a reflective early years workforce'

-Karen Ward, Senior Lecturer in Early Years, Birmingham City University

Work-based reflective learning is a key part of the professional development of practitioners working in the
early years sector. The Reflective Early Years Practitioner focuses on the practitioner's role and development
within a wide range of contexts in this area.

Informed by empirical research, packed with case studies from a wide range of settings and with points for
reflection in each chapter, the author covers:

- developing as an early years practitioner

- reflective vocational progression

- pedagogical examples for continuing professional development

- study skills to begin reflective practice

- professionalism and reflective leadership in the early years

Vital aspects of practice, such as assessing and planning for children's learning, developing inclusive
teaching strategies and integrated practice are highlighted within the chapters.



This is essential reading for students undertaking work-based and academic study in early years and for those
working towards post-graduate and professional qualifications. It provides readers with tools to continually
practice work-based reflective learning now and in the future.
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From reader reviews:

Debbie Siegel:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important take action,
like looking for your favorite reserve and reading a publication. Beside you can solve your trouble; you can
add your knowledge by the book entitled The Reflective Early Years Practitioner. Try to make the book The
Reflective Early Years Practitioner as your friend. It means that it can to be your friend when you experience
alone and beside that course make you smarter than ever. Yeah, it is very fortuned to suit your needs. The
book makes you far more confidence because you can know everything by the book. So , we should make
new experience and knowledge with this book.

Christopher Gaul:

Throughout other case, little individuals like to read book The Reflective Early Years Practitioner. You can
choose the best book if you love reading a book. Given that we know about how is important any book The
Reflective Early Years Practitioner. You can add expertise and of course you can around the world by just a
book. Absolutely right, simply because from book you can realize everything! From your country until
finally foreign or abroad you may be known. About simple factor until wonderful thing you are able to know
that. In this era, we could open a book or searching by internet unit. It is called e-book. You should use it
when you feel bored stiff to go to the library. Let's examine.

Effie Peoples:

What do you regarding book? It is not important along? Or just adding material when you want something to
explain what yours problem? How about your time? Or are you busy man or woman? If you don't have spare
time to do others business, it is make you feel bored faster. And you have free time? What did you do?
Everyone has many questions above. They must answer that question since just their can do which. It said
that about reserve. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is right. Because start from on kindergarten until
university need this specific The Reflective Early Years Practitioner to read.

Carla Helton:

Reading a e-book make you to get more knowledge from the jawhorse. You can take knowledge and
information originating from a book. Book is created or printed or created from each source that filled update
of news. In this particular modern era like right now, many ways to get information are available for an
individual. From media social such as newspaper, magazines, science book, encyclopedia, reference book,
new and comic. You can add your knowledge by that book. Are you hip to spend your spare time to open
your book? Or just in search of the The Reflective Early Years Practitioner when you required it?
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