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Isolated by much of the world for its conduct of the war in Vietnam, the United States saw British support as
a key component of its efforts to sway public opinion. This is the first serious examination of the impact of
the Vietnam War on the Anglo-American special relationship during the years of the Johnson presidency.
Using recently released government papers, oral interviews, and transcripts of presidential phone
conversations, Ellis discusses the discord between the United Kingdom and the United States over the war in
Southeast Asia. She focuses on the pressures placed on Prime Minister Harold Wilson's Labor Government
to provide material aid to the war and to remain squarely behind the U.S. war effort in public.

Britain's refusal to send troops to Vietnam and Wilson's insistence on trying to mediate the conflict were
both sources of tension between the allies. This study explores the extent to which the United Kingdom was
pressured to send troops to the combat zone, the part that the personal relationship between Wilson and
Johnson played in the tensions, and the evidence that a deal was done to link the maintenance of British
defenses East of Suez with U.S. support for the pound sterling. It concludes that Wilson managed to walk a
political tightrope on Vietnam, providing just enough diplomatic support for the Americans to keep
Washington satisfied and putting just enough limits on that support to keep an increasingly vociferous
domestic anti-war movement at bay.
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From reader reviews:

Joseph Fulkerson:

What do you ponder on book? It is just for students since they are still students or it for all people in the
world, the actual best subject for that? Just simply you can be answered for that issue above. Every person
has various personality and hobby for each other. Don't to be obligated someone or something that they don't
would like do that. You must know how great and also important the book Britain, America, and the
Vietnam War (International History). All type of book could you see on many resources. You can look for
the internet methods or other social media.

Jacob Brown:

The actual book Britain, America, and the Vietnam War (International History) will bring you to definitely
the new experience of reading the book. The author style to explain the idea is very unique. In case you try to
find new book to read, this book very suitable to you. The book Britain, America, and the Vietnam War
(International History) is much recommended to you to read. You can also get the e-book from the official
web site, so you can quicker to read the book.

Katie Broadnax:

Are you kind of occupied person, only have 10 or 15 minute in your time to upgrading your mind expertise
or thinking skill also analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book compared to can
satisfy your short period of time to read it because this all time you only find publication that need more time
to be go through. Britain, America, and the Vietnam War (International History) can be your answer because
it can be read by you actually who have those short spare time problems.

Marilyn Oxford:

You can obtain this Britain, America, and the Vietnam War (International History) by check out the
bookstore or Mall. Just viewing or reviewing it may to be your solve issue if you get difficulties for your
knowledge. Kinds of this publication are various. Not only by means of written or printed but in addition can
you enjoy this book by means of e-book. In the modern era like now, you just looking by your mobile phone
and searching what their problem. Right now, choose your ways to get more information about your book. It
is most important to arrange you to ultimately make your knowledge are still change. Let's try to choose
appropriate ways for you.
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