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From Book 1:

"They say I'm wired bad, or wired sad, but there's no doubt about it -- I'm wired."

Joey Pigza's got heart, he's got a mom who loves him, and he's got "dud meds," which is what he calls the
Ritalin pills that are supposed to even out his wild mood swings. Sometimes Joey makes bad choices. He
learns the hard way that he shouldn't stick his finger in the pencil sharpener, or swallow his house key, or run
with scissors. Joey ends up bouncing around a lot - and eventually he bounces himself all the way downown,
into the district special-ed program, which could be the end of the line. As Joey knows, if he keeps making
bad choices, he could just fall between the cracks for good. But he is determined not to let that happen.

In this antic yet poignant new novel, Jack Gantos has perfect pitch in capturing the humor, the off-the-wall
intensity, and the serious challenges that life presents to a kid dealing with hyper-activity and related
disorders.

Joey Pigza Swallowed the Key is a 1998 National Book Award Finalist for Young People's Literature.
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From reader reviews:

Freddie Hoops:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important act, like
looking for your favorite e-book and reading a reserve. Beside you can solve your condition; you can add
your knowledge by the e-book entitled Joey Pigza (5 Book Series). Try to make book Joey Pigza (5 Book
Series) as your friend. It means that it can being your friend when you really feel alone and beside those of
course make you smarter than in the past. Yeah, it is very fortuned for you. The book makes you far more
confidence because you can know every thing by the book. So , let's make new experience in addition to
knowledge with this book.

Jetta Butler:

In this 21st one hundred year, people become competitive in each way. By being competitive currently,
people have do something to make these survives, being in the middle of typically the crowded place and
notice by means of surrounding. One thing that sometimes many people have underestimated the item for a
while is reading. Yeah, by reading a reserve your ability to survive raise then having chance to stand up than
other is high. To suit your needs who want to start reading any book, we give you this particular Joey Pigza
(5 Book Series) book as starter and daily reading e-book. Why, because this book is usually more than just a
book.

Alfonso Miller:

As people who live in typically the modest era should be up-date about what going on or info even
knowledge to make these individuals keep up with the era which is always change and advance. Some of you
maybe can update themselves by reading through books. It is a good choice to suit your needs but the
problems coming to a person is you don't know what kind you should start with. This Joey Pigza (5 Book
Series) is our recommendation to cause you to keep up with the world. Why, as this book serves what you
want and need in this era.

William Duhon:

People live in this new morning of lifestyle always try and and must have the extra time or they will get large
amount of stress from both day to day life and work. So , once we ask do people have extra time, we will say
absolutely indeed. People is human not really a huge robot. Then we request again, what kind of activity are
there when the spare time coming to a person of course your answer will unlimited right. Then do you ever
try this one, reading guides. It can be your alternative within spending your spare time, the actual book you
have read is definitely Joey Pigza (5 Book Series).
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